BID 1: BLACK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
BID 2: CROMIE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
BID 3: SIERSMA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
BID 4: SUSICK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
BID 5: CAREER PREPARATION CENTER
BID 6: EDUCATIONAL SERVICE CENTER
BID 7: COUSINO HIGH SCHOOL
BID'8: MOTT HIGH SCHOOL
BID % ANGUS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, HARWOOD ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, WILLOW WOODS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, BEER M8, CARLETON MS, CARTER MS§, GRISSOM MS, STERLING HEIGHTS HS

WARREN CONSOLIDATED SCHOOLS

Asbestos Abatement Bid Tabulation

January 16, 2019

CONTRACTOR B FAMILIAL IRAN
BOND | DISCLOSURE | DISCLOSURE | ADDENDUM BID 1 BID 2 BID 5 BID 4 B3 B 6 B} 7 B3 8 BID &
STATEMENT | STATEMENT L
v v v v
QUALITY ENVRONMENTAL SEKVICHS $176,000 $23,200 $74,000 $118,200 $49,400 $24,100 $71,400 $65,350 $35,000
v v v
QUALIFIED ABATEMENT SERVICES v $350,000 $45,000 $165,000 $265,000 $48,000 $38,000 $45,000 368,000 $39.000
v v v
A HONMENTAL MATTENANCE FNGA RS v $250,000 $30,000 $110,000 $200,000 $50,0_00 $30,000 $76,000 $81,000 $65,000
v v v v
OTAL PRVIONMENTAL NO BID $36,675 NO BID NO BID NO BID 833,690 NO BID NO BID NO BID
v v v
TRUST THERMAL ABSATEMENT v $219,000 $94,000 $94,000 $188,600 $103,000 $64,500 $77,000 $77,300 $29,000
v v v v
DS ENVIRO - $166,000 $33,300 $75,800 $122,900 $56,000 $22,000 $49,000 $44 610 $26,700
N.
METROPOLITAN ENVERONMENTAL A NA NA NA NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
NA NA NA NA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOBAL OREEN SERVICE GROUP
v v v
M LAKES ENVIKONMENTAL SERVICE INC. v $150,500 316,320 $62,376 $110,560 $31,260 $17,415 $39,686 $50,526 $23,780
v v v v NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOC BID $51,268

MWy




WARREN CONSOLIDPATED SCHOOLS
Asbestos Abatement Bid Tabulation — Unit Prices

January 16, 2019

PIPE-FITFTAASTICKARPET/DOOR/ 4° X 7' FRAME/?' X 7" FRAME/PARTITION WALL CAULK
CONTRACTOR MOBILIZATION TACKBOARD SCRAPE Pozs;acxsomw GRIND PODS

QUALITY ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES %400 $22.00/$1.85/51.45/3.00/$80.00/$300.00/3385.00/510.00/89.00/510.00
QUALIFIED ABATEMENT SERVICES $5G0 $30.00/$3.00/$3.50/$2.00/$1 50.00/$480.00/$650.00/8100.00/510.00/815.00
ENVIRONMENTAL MAINTENANCE ENGINEERS £300 $30.00/$2.00/$3.50/51.00/5150.00/3300.00/$500.00/%8.00/510.00/320.00
TOTAL ENVIRONMENTAL 3850 $27.00/82.50/54.50/51.50/$350.00/$350.00/$550.00/812 00/86.00/32.00
TRUST THERMAL ABATEMENT $6350 $30.00/82.00/$2.00/81,00/%125.00/5400,00/5850.00/51 2.00/51 0,00/520.00
B8 ENVIRONMENTAL F500 $25.00/82.00/52.00/5.50/$75.00/8100.00/8125.00/5 15 00/$5 00/$7.00
METROPOLITAN ENVIRONMENTAL NO BID NO BID
GLOBAL GREEN SERVICE GROUF NO BID NO BID
GREAT LAKES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICE INC. 3350 $12.00/8.95/53.25/5,95/$125.00/8125.00/5275.00 (EXT 400.00)§3.00/52.00/35.00
MWV 3350 $15.00/84.00/54.00/$3.00/$75.00/5175.00/51 75.00/$5 00/85.00/$7.00




WARREN CONSOLIDATED SCHOOLS

Asbestos Abatement Bid Tabuiation — T & M Prices

January 16, 2019

T&M T&M T&M
CONTRACTOR M-F SATURDAY SUNDAY & HOLIDAY
QUALITY ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES $95/HR. $120/HR $135HR
QUALIFIED ABATEMENT SERVICES $80/HR £96/HR. $112/HR
ENVIRONMENTAL MAINTENANCE ENGINEERS $70HR £85/HR $110/HR
TOTAL ENVIRONMENTAL $70/HR $90/HR, $110HR
TRUST THERMAL ABATEMENT $105/HR $155/HR $205/HR
BDS ENVIRONMENTAL $75/HR E90/HR $95/HR
METROPOLITAN ENVIRONMENTAL NG BID NO BID NO BID
GLOBAL GREEN SERVICE GROUF NO BID NO BID NORBID
GREAT LAKES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICE INC. $55/HR £32. 50/HR $110/HR,
MWV $55/HR $65/HR ' $75/HR




